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1. Introduction  
 
The collaboration has been going from strength to strength since its establishment in 2017 
and at 31st March 2021 81% of the Gwynedd fund has been pooled with Wales Pension 
Partnership – 54% through the main funds and 27% through passive investments. 

The performance to date has been very satisfactory and many developments are underway 
and therefore this paper provides an update for the Committee. 

2. Global Equity funds  
 
These funds were established in February 2019 and their performance up to 30th June 2021 
can be seen below. 

Global Growth Fund 

This is a Global fund consisting of three underlying investment managers (Baillie Gifford, 
Veritas and Pzena) and Link as the investment manager. 

  
Three 

Months One Year Since Inception 

     
Performance 5.7 29.7 17.9 
     
Benchmark 7.3 24.6 16.1 
     
Excess returns -1.6 5.1 1.9 

 

The Fund has consistently performed well above the benchmark with strong performance 
since inception by Baillie Gifford. Baillie Gifford invests in companies where they believe they 
have a sustainable competitive advantage in their industries and will grow earnings faster than 
the market average. Pzena has historically been underperforming but has recently benefited 
with value stocks performing well. 

In the quarter to June 2021 Global equity markets continued to ascend in the quarter, with US, 
European and Emerging Market stocks all performing strongly. Japanese equities declined 
modestly, partially due to a deteriorating COVID-19 situation. However, the Fund suffered 
underperformance of its benchmark in the quarter. Pzena’s value strategy began the quarter 
well but suffered during June on the back of investor sentiment, ending the quarter down 4.2% 
versus its benchmark. The anti-value move was most pronounced in the US and Europe – the 
portfolio’s two highest regional weightings. Veritas also suffered underperformance (-0.4%) 
along with Baillie Gifford (-0.3%) for the quarter. 

 

 

 



Global Opportunities Fund 

This is a Global and Regional fund consisting of seven underlying investment managers 
(Morgan Stanley, Numeric, Sanders, Jacobs Levy, SW Mitchell, NWQ and Oaktree) and 
Russell Investments as the investment manager. Performance to 30th June 2021 has been as 
follows: 

 

This fund is based on a blended approach with a number of different styles (such as value and 
growth) that complement each other. The Fund has performed well since inception but finished 
behind the benchmark in the quarter to 30th June 2021. Growth styles outperformed value over 
the quarter, despite value outperforming on a year-to-date basis. As such, SW Mitchell 
(growth) finished in line with its benchmark, whilst Sanders (value) struggled over the period. 
Quality and large cap stocks also performed well, benefitting Oaktree (emerging).  

3. Fixed Income Funds 

The Partnership launched five fixed income sub funds in July and September 2020 and 
Gwynedd Pension Fund has invested in two of them: Multi Asset Credit Fund and Absolute 
Return Bond Fund.  

Multi Asset Credit Fund 

Our global equity from Fidelity transferred to this fund in July 2020. This fund has five 
underlying investment managers (ICG, Man GLG, BlueBay, Barings and Voya) and Russell 
Investments as the investment manager. The performance up to 31st March 2021 was as 
follows: 

  
Three 

Months Since Inception 

    
Performance 1.8 7.8 

    
Benchmark 1.0 3.6 

    
Excess returns 0.8 4.2 

 

The Fund returned above its target over the quarter. The Fed raised their future interest rate 
expectations at their monthly policy meeting. This suited the floating rate nature of loans, with 
loans specialist ICG performing well within this environment. The continued re-opening of the 
economy underpinned strength in US securitised assets.  

 

 

 

 

Three 
Months One Year 

Since 
Inception 

    
Performance 6.4 27.1 16.6 

    
Benchmark 7.3 24.6 15.4 

    
Excess returns -0.9 2.5 1.2 



Absolute Return Bond Fund 

Our bonds from Insight was transferred to this fund in September 2020. This fund has four 
underlying managers (Wellington, Putnam, Aegon and Insight) and Russell Investments as 
the investment manager. The performance up to 31st March 2021 was as follows: 

  
Three 

Months 
Since  

Inception 

    
Performance  -0.3 1.7 

    
Benchmark 0.5 1.5 

    
Excess returns -0.8 0.2 

 

The Fund returned below its target this quarter. Inflation data rose swiftly this quarter, aided 
by ongoing fiscal support, higher economic activity and supply-chain constraints. Credit 
spreads tightened further which contributed to good performance in asset-backed securities. 
Within this environment, US yields fell and the yield curve flattened, as longer-term yields fell 
more than their intermediate-term counterparts.  

4. Developments 

4.1 Emerging Markets 

The latest transition that is taking place is Emerging Markets. The fund structure, potential 
managers and fee estimates have been approved by the Joint Committee, and the prospectus 
was approved by the FCA in March 2021. 

The Gwynedd fund is currently moving its Emerging Markets share from Fidelity to this fund 
and the process has started on 20th October 2021. 

4.2 Private Markets  

A working group has been established looking at the options of combining assets into this 
category with the assistance of Hymans Robertson. An assessment of the requirements of 
each fund has been made with ongoing discussion to determine the appropriate structure and 
mechanism for the investments. 
 
Private Credit and Infrastructure are two of the main focus areas with global properties also 
being considered. 
 
The launch of private market investments is more complex than listed market equivalents and 
the inability to utilise the Authorised Contractual Scheme (ACS) which already holds the 
WPP’s equity and fixed income assets, and therefore an alternative legal structure is required.  
 
In July 2021, the JGC approved the appointment of a specialist search advisor, Bfinance who 
will assist the WPP and its constituent authorities in search and selection of the appropriate 
investment managers to manage its private markets allocations. A revised timetable for 
expected launch and commitment to Private Credit and Infrastructure is being developed with 
the WPP intent on launching these asset classes by during 2022. 
 

 

 

 



4.3 Member Representative on the Joint Governance Committee 

At its meeting on 24th March 2021 the Joint Committee considered a report on the Scheme 
Member Representative, which detailed the recommended appointment process and person 
specification prepared by the Officer Working Group. 
  
With regard to the appointment process, the report recommended that each local Pension 
Board should nominate one scheme member representative who would submit an expression 
of interest setting out its particular merits against the person specification. The appointment 
process would be undertaken by a Joint Governance Committee sub-group who would submit 
an appointment recommendation for approval by the Joint Governance Committee. 
  
In terms of the appointment process it was agreed that the appointment should be two years 
and that the appointment should include a deputy representative from a different Pension 
Board to the Scheme Member Representative. 
 
The process requires changes to the Inter Authority Agreement which require full Council 
approval from each constituent authority. The changes to the IAA were agreed by the full 
Council in Gwynedd on October 7th 2021.  
 

4.4 WPP Annual Return 2020/21 

The Wales Pension Partnership is not legally required to prepare a full set of annual report 
and accounts in the same way as the Pension Fund, the requirement is that accounts are 
prepared in the form of an annual return. The costs of the WPP for 2020/21 stood at £706,000. 

The annual report and all WPP policies and documents can be seen on the Wales Pension 
Partnership website: www.walespensionpartnership.org 

 
 

5. Recommendation 

The Committee is asked to note the information.  

 

http://www.walespensionpartnership.org/

